

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES  
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS  
TABULATION OF BIDS FOR  
FRONT END LOADER RENTALS

Bid Opening Date:	April 14, 2016	Address	Custom Truck & Equip	Buck Bros. Inc	Patten Cat	McAllister Equip. Co.
Time:	9:00 a.m.	Phone:	1700 Leider Dr. Union, WI 53182 816-520-4640	14N937 US Hwy 20 Hampshire, IL 60140 847-683-4440	625W Lake St. Elmhurst, IL 60126 630-432-2933	12500 S. Cicero Ave. Alsip, IL 60803 708-389-7700
Attended by:	Bev Romanoff and Kelly Kerr	E-mail:	Doug Williams	Lindsey Parsons	irexlerr@pattencat.com	smortensen@mcquippco.com
Bid Deposit:	None Required	Contact:	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Amount of Deposit Received:			Yes	No	Yes	Yes
Bid Certification Form Notarized:			Yes	No	Yes	Yes
Substance Abuse Prevention Certificate:			Yes	No	Yes	Yes
References Provided:			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Total	Total	Total	Total
	Items		Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Total	Total	Total	Total
Tractor manufacturer			Kawasaki	John Deere	Caterpillar	Volvo
Manufacturer Model			80-ZV-2		924	L70H
Model Year			2012		2015	2016
Proposal 1 of 2						
Rental Cost for December 2016			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Rental Cost for January 2017			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Rental Cost for February 2017			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Rental Cost for March 2017			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Proposal 2 of 2						
Rental Cost for December 2016			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Rental Cost for January 2017			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Rental Cost for February 2017			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Rental Cost for March 2017			\$6,000.00	No bid	\$2,950.00	\$2,500.00
Constant with all Proposals						
Maximum Rental Hours per Month (incl within monthly rental)			none		80	80
Hourly Rental Cost Beyond Monthly Max.			\$0.00		\$39.38	\$31.00
Are Rental Hours Accumulative Over a Four Month Period			n/a		yes	yes
Delivery Charge (if applicable) X2			\$3,650.00		\$285.00	\$0.00
Pick-up Charge (if applicable) X2			\$1,550.00		\$285.00	\$0.00
Additional Charges (identify)			None		None	None
Total Bid			\$58,400.00	No bid	\$24,740.00	\$20,000.00